
Year 6 SATs Survival: Grammar, Punctuation & Spelling Booster Intervention Pack 5: Vocabulary & Standard English Overview

Session 1 Session 2 Session 3 Session 4 Session 5

Warm-Up

Family Mind Maps
Children are to mind-

map at least three words 
belonging to a range of 
different word families.

Find the Family
Circle all of the words 
belonging to the ‘spec’ 
word family in a short 

passage of text. Can the 
child define them?

Family Trees
Sort the list of given 

words into families and 
attach them to the correct 

family tree. 

Family Secrets
Children are to solve the 

clues to write a word from 
a given word family which 

fits a definition.

Follow the Family
Children are to find the 
paths through the maze 
by following words within 

the same families.

Input

Super Synonyms
Children explore shades of 
meaning by making paper 

chains of words which 
have the same meaning.

Prefix Jigsaws
Recap a range of prefixes 
and how they change the 
meaning of words. Match 
the prefix to its meaning. 

Sort the Suffixes
Recap a range of suffixes 

and how they change 
the root word. Match the 

suffix to what it does.

Standard English
Define Standard English. 

Sort sentences into 
those which are and 
are not written in 
Standard English.

Formal or Informal?
Explore formal and 

informal word choices. 
Replace informal choices 

within sentences.

Apply

All of the Antonyms
Children give sentences 
the opposite meaning by 
replacing adjectives with 

suitable antonyms.

Match the Meaning
Match up words to their 
definition based on the 
prefix used at the start 

of the word.

Finish It Off
Add the correct suffix to a 
root word to complete the 
word correctly within the 
context of a sentence.

Translate It
Rewrite a range of 

non-Standard English 
sentences correctly, 

exploring the changes that 
are needed.

A Formal Invitation
Select the correct word 
from a list provided to 

complete sentences in the 
most formal way possible.

Assess & Review

SATs-Style Questions
Answer two SATs-style 
questions on synonyms 
and antonyms. Mark and 
address misconceptions.

SATs-Style Questions
Answer two SATs-style 
questions on applying 

prefixes. Mark and address 
misconceptions.

SATs-Style Questions
Answer two SATs-style 
questions on applying 

suffixes. Mark and address 
misconceptions

SATs-Style Questions
Answer two SATs-style 
questions on Standard 

English. Mark and address 
misconceptions.

Spelling Test
Use Spelling 

Dictation Test 5.

Celebrate
Celebrate achievement 

with stickers and 
certificates.

Suggested Home Learning Links: 
Children read and rewrite a simple passage using synonyms to create a stronger meaning and antonyms to create the opposite meaning.
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