
This summer, the 2024 Olympics, held in 
Paris, will run from 26th July to 11th 
August, and the Paralympics will take 
place from 28th August to 8th September. 
The Games will see the world's greatest 
athletes come together in France's capital 
city to compete for their place at the top 
of the podium. For many athletes, these 
Games are the peak of their sport, with a 
gold medal as the highest accolade. The 
competitors are likely to have spent 
months and years training for numerous 
hours per day to prepare.

In the news this week
Share your knowledge of the upcoming 
2024 Olympic and Paralympic Games. 
Ask someone at home to share their 
experience with you.

Will you be watching any of the events? 
Which sports do you find most 
interesting and why?

Things to talk about at home ...
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Please note any interesting thoughts or comments

Share your thoughts and read the opinions of others
www.picture-news.co.uk/discuss

www.picture-news.co.uk/discuss

What does it take
to be an Olympian
or Paralympian?
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