
Remote Learning Lessons ~ Monday 25th January 

 Learning 
Objective 

 

Task 1 
Mild 

Task 2 
Spicy 

Task 3 
Practical 

Digital Learning 

English Revise different 
spellings for the 
‘oo’ sound 
family. 

Write the oo words to match 
the pictures you can see (on 
the website). 

Write a sentence for each of 
the /oo/ sounds we have 
looked at today (oo, ue, u_e, 
ew).  

 
Can you have three 

words with that sound in 
each sentence? 

Play Musical Statues with your 
grownup and every time the 
music stops, say a word 
containing today’s sound. 

Phonics Play games: 
https://www.phonicsplay.co.uk/ 
 
oo song: 
https://www.youtube.com/watch
?v=6xKSI-_ATOE 
 
 
 

Maths To find and 
make number 
bonds to 10 and 
20 

How many number pairs can 
you find that make 10?  

Year 1: 
Practise number bonds to 
make 10 and 20. Have a look 
at the Spicy task on the 

website. 😊 
 
Year 2: 
Number bonds to make 20 
(See website) 

Make a number bonds 
rainbow! (You could choose 
number bonds for 10, 20 or 
even tens number bonds for 
100!) 

 

BBC Numberblocks - number 
pairs to make 10: 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/iplayer/e
pisode/b0bn5k6h/numberblocks-
series-3-ten-again 
 
Farmer Pete number bonds song: 
https://www.youtube.com/watch
?v=poJmS5iWfEs&feature=youtu.
be 
 
 
 

Topic: Science Describe how 
different 
habitats provide 
for the basic 
needs of 
different kinds 

Add body part labels to the 
penguin picture (on our 
website). 

Draw a penguin (there is a 
page on our website to 
show you how!) and write 
labels / captions to show 
what you have learned 

Can you move like a penguin?! 
Try making these movements 
into a dance routine to show 
the life of a penguin colony. If 
you’re feeling brave, send me 
the video!  

Emperor penguin clip: 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/teach/cla
ss-clips-video/science-ks1-ks2-
wonders-of-nature-emperor-
penguins/zm3ygwx 
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of animals and 
plants, and how 
they depend on 
each other 
 

about how they survive in 
Antarctica. 

What is a polar habitat? 
https://www.bbc.co.uk/bitesize/t
opics/zx882hv/articles/z3sr4wx 
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