
Spring Term  
 Life on earth  

(Art & Science focus) 

 
 

On the way 
 

 

Good 
 

 

Wow 
 

 

Can I create a simple representation of 
myself? 

Can I explore what happens when I mix 
colours? 

Can I choose particular colours for a 
purpose? 

Can I experiment with texture? 

Can I use simple tools and techniques 
competently and appropriately? 

 

Can I talk about where I live? 

Can I identify and describe plants and 
animals? 

Do I understand what growth is? 

Do I know how to care for living things? 

 

 

I can draw a simple picture of a face. 
 
I know mixing colours makes a new 
colour.  
 
I select colours to use in my artwork. 
 
I know I can use tools to make different 
marks. 
  
I can talk about the place where I live. 
 
I can identify plants and animals that I 
have seen.  
 
I can see when growth happens. 
 
I know why it is important to care for 
living things.  
 
I can spot similarities and differences 
between living things.  

I can draw my face with all the correct 
features. 
 
I can mix colours and talk about the new 
colours I have made. 
 
I can choose accurate colours to 
represent what I am painting.  
 
I can choose the right tools to create 
different textures. 
 
I have thought about what I am going to 
use before I start. 
 
I can comment and ask questions about 
the place where I live and the natural 
world. 
 
I can talk about plants, animals and 
natural objects that I have seen. 
 
I have an understanding of growth and 
changes over time. 
 
I show care and concern for living things. 
 
I can talk about similarities and 
differences about living things. 
 
 

I can draw a detailed representation of 
my face with all the correct features.  
 
I know how to mix colours to make new 
colours of my choice. 
 
I can mix the accurate colours to 
represent what I want to paint.  
 
I can explore different ways to create 
textures with paint and use the 
equipment safely. 
 
I can think of my own ideas for how I 
want to recreate pictures in the style of 
Eric Carle. 
 
I can explain why I have used certain 
tools and equipment. 
 
I can talk about features of my immediate 
environment and discuss how 
environments may differ from one 
another. 
 
I can make observations of animals and 
plants and explain why changes happen. 
 
I know how to care for living things and 
know how different living things need to 
be cared for differently. 

 


